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Home Loans

CIN: U65990DL2017PLC322041

Registered Office: 2nd Floor, DLF Centre,

Sansad Marg, New Delhi - 110001
CAPITALINDIA Tel:+91 114954 6000 Email: cihl@capitalindia.com

Website: www.capitalindiahomeloans.com,
Registration Code - Corporate Agent CA0688.

PUBLIC NOTICE FOR GLOSING OF THE BRANCH OFFICE AT ANDHERI, MUMBAI

Notice is hereby given to the customers, service providers and all related
persons / parties of Capital India Home Loans Limited (“Company”)
that the Branch Office of the Company at Andheri, Mumbai having
address at Capital India Home Loans Limited, 713/714, A Wing,
Kanakia Wall Street, Chakala, Andheri (East), Mumbai 400 093 will
be closing after Three Months of this notice.
All concerned persons/parties are hereby advised to kindly take a
note of aforesaid the closing of the above said Branch. For any
assistance, kindly contact the Company + 91-22-4503 6077 or refer
to the website of the Company at www.capitalindiahomeloans.com.
DATE : 13:01-2024, PLACE : ANDHERI, MUMBAI S~ AUTHORISED QFFICER, CAPITAL INDIA HOME LOANS LIMITED

D PARBHANI CITY MUNICIPAL
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CORPORATION, PARBHANI

PRESS TENDER NOTICE

E-Tender Notice No. 180 for 2023-24

Date : 10.01.2024

Parbhani City Municipal Corporation invites e-Tender for the
work of "Invitation for Expression of Interest (EOI) Day to day
Operation, Maintenance & Repairs of Parbhani Municipal
Solid waste (Wet And Dry Waste) processing plant of capacity
100 MT & Biogas Plant of capacity 10 MT and sanitary
Landfill site at (Borwand kh) of PCMC" along with necessary
spares and electricity bill For Parbhani Municipal Corporation,
Parbhani. in the State of Maharashtra, Please visit website

r("\\ Tree House Education & Accessories Limited
eefouse Regd. Office: 101, Sapphire Plaza, Dadabhai Road, Opp. CNMS School,
Lé:\, Vile Parle West , Mumbai - 400 056 * CIN No.: L80101MH2006PLC163028
Playgroup & Nursery Website: www.treehouseplaygroup.net « Email: compliance@treehouseplaygroup.net
‘From roots to wings'
e i B i (Rs. in Lakhs)
Standalone Consolidated
Sr Particulars Quarter Ended 9 Months Ended Year Ended Quarter Ended 9 Months Ended Year Ended
No. Unaudited Unaudited Unaudited Unaudited Unaudited Audited Unaudited Unaudited Unaudited Unaudited Unaudited Audited
31-12-2023 | 30-09-2023 | 31-12-2022 | 31-12-2023 | 31-12-2022 | 31-03-2023 | 31-12-2023 | 30-09-2023 | 31-12-2022 | 31-12-2023 | 31-12-2022 | 31-03-2023
1 | Total income from operations (net) 219 209 172 664 556 1,102 219 209 172 664 556 1,102
2 | Net profit/ (Loss) for the period 6 17 (516) 40 (4,544) (5,018) 6 17 (516) 40 (4,544) (5,018)
(before Tax, Exceptional and/ or
Extraordinary items)
3 | Net profit/ (Loss) for the period before Tax 6 17 (516) 40 (4,544) (5,209) 6 13 (516) 36 (4,544) (5,209)
(after Exceptional and/ or Extraordinary
items)
4 | Net profit/ (Loss) for the period after Tax (83) (83) (516) (249) (4,544) (4,466) (83) (87) (516) (253) (4,544) (4,466)
(after Exceptional and/ or Extraordinary
items)
5 | Total Comprehensive income for the (83) (83) (516) (249) (4,544) (4,466) (83) (87) (516) (253) (4,544) (4,466)
period [Comprising Profit / (Loss) for the
period (after tax) and other Comprehensive
Income (after tax)]
6 | Paid up Equity Share Capital 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231 4,231
(Face Value of the share Rs.10 /- each)
7 | Reserves (excluding revaluation reserves*) 17,273 17,608
8 | Earnings per Share (of Rs.10/- each) in
Rs. After exceptional ltems
a) Basic (0.20) (0.20) 1.22) (0.59) (10.74) (10.56) (0.20) (0.21) 1.22) (0.60) (10.74) (10.56)
b) Diluted (0.20) (0.20) 1.22) (0.59) (10.74) (10.56) (0.20) ( 1.22) (0.60) (10.74) (10.56)

* Reserves excluding revaluation Reserves.
Notes:

www.mahatenders.gov.in from Date 12/01//2024 or detailed a) The aboye is an extract of the dgtailed format of Quarterly / Annual Finapcial Re§ults fileq with Stock E>l<chlanges under Regullatilon 33 of the SEBI (Ljsting Obligation Disclosure Rquirements) Regulation 2015. The full format of Quarterly /
information. Annual Financial Results are available on the Stock Exchange(s) and the listed entity websites (www.bseindia.com/www.nseindia.com/www.msei.in) as well as on company's website www.treehouseplaygroup.net.
b) The financial results of the Company have been prepared in accordance with Indian Accounting Standards (Ind AS) notified under the Companies (Indian Accounting Standards) Rules, 2015 as amended by the Companies (Indian Accounting
Sd/- Standards) (Amendment) Rules, 2016.
Additional Commissioner ¢) Exceptionaland/ or Extraordinary items adjusted in the statement of Profit and Loss in accordance with Ind-AS-Rules.
Parbhani City Municipal Corporation Forand on behalf of the Board of Directors
Parbhani Rai st?/lih i
ajesh Bhatia
Place: Mumbai Managing Director
. th .
PRO FIN CAPITAL SERVICES LIMITED Date: 12" January 2024 DIN No.: 00074393
(CIN: L51909MH1991PLC250695)
Regd. Office: 503, Western Edge II, Western Express Highway,
Borivali (E), Mumbai - 400 066
Website: wlww.p‘rofinclapitaIAcom + Email: profin.capital1@gmail.com Public Notice For E-Auction Cum Sale (Appendix - IV A) (Rule 8(6)) Borrower(s) / Demand Notice Description of the Immovable Date of Physical Reserve Price
Statement of Un-Audited Financial Results for the quarter ended on 31st December, 2023 Sale of Immovable property mortgaged to IIFL Home Finance Limited (Formerly known as India Infoline Housing Finance Ltd.) (IIFL-HFL) Corporate| ~Co-Borrower(s) / Date and Amount property/ Secured Asset P i
(Rs. In Lakhs) Office at Plot No.98,Udyog Vihar, Phase-V,Gurgaon-122015.(Haryana) and Branch Office at:-"Shop No.201,The Edge,2nd floor Behind Guarantor(s) 18-Sep-2019 & Rs.19,80,381/- |All that part and parcel of the property Flat No. 27-Feb-2023 Rs. 7,00,000/- (Rupees
Particulars Standalone Prakash Talkies,near ICICI Bank Palghar (W) - 401404 "/ "CTS NO 4278/1 to-7 Tanaji Nagar Near Kalika Mata Mandir 2nd Floor Chichwad | 1.Mr.RamNatthulal | (Rupees Nineteen Lakh Eighty |G2 on the Ground Floor Wing C ,Building 12, [ Total O fing As Seven Lakh Only)
Pune -411033 / "Shop No.201,The Edge,2nd floor Behind Prakash Talkies,near ICICI Bank Palghar (W) - 401404 "/ "IIFL House, Sun Singh Thousand Three Hundred  |Building Type B1 ,Building Known as "Sodhi| QOn Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money
Quarter Ended Infotech Park Road No. 16V, Plot No.B-23 , Thane Industrial Area, Wagle Estate, Thane - 400604" under the Securitisation and Reconstruction | 2.Mrs.Shalu Diwakar Eighty One Only) Presidency "Village "PAM- Tembhi Gram| Rs.28,94,482)- (Rupees Deposit (EMD)
31/12/2023  30/09/2023 31/12/2022 of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (hereinafter "Act"). Whereas the Auhorized Officer ("AQ") of IIFL-HFL had taken (Prospect )NO Bid Increase Amount _[Panchayat Boisar ,Panchayat Samiti , Taluka | Twenty Eight Lakh Ninety | Rs. 70,000/- (Rupees
- - the possession of the following property/ies pursuant to the notice issued U/S 13(2) of the Act in the following loan accounts/prospect nos. with a 853131 Rs. 20,000/ (Rupees Twenty |Palghar, Dist. Thane ,400104 Maharashtra Four Thousand Four Seventy Thousand
1) Total income from operations (net) 58290 | 436.578 | 531.09 right to sell the same on "AS IS WHERE IS BASIS, AS IS WHAT IS BASIS AND WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS" for realization of IIFL-HFL's dues, Thousand Only) (Area Ad Measuring 530 Sq. Ft.) Hundred Eighty Two Only) Only)
2)Net Profit / (Loss) for the period 98.246 92.118 16.228 The Sale will be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website:www.iiflonehome.com 1. Mr. Tushar 18-0ct-2022 & Rs.12,60,827/- | All that part & parcel of the property bearing Unit 22-Aug-2023 Rs. 5,00,000 /-
before Tax, Exceptional and/or Borrower(s) / Demand Notice Description of the Inmovable Date of Physical . Bhimrao Jadhav (Rupees Twelve Lakh Sixty |No. A4-207, 2nd Fir, Carpet Area Ad M i Total Outstanding A: (Rupees Five Lakh
(E traordi it P Co-Borrower(s) / Date and Amount property/ Secured Asset P i Reserve Price 2. Mr.Bhimrao Thousand Eight Hundred {215 Sq.Ft, and Super Built Up Area Ad oonaDate 03_Jan_202: Only)
xiraordinary items) i Guarantor(s)  [75.Aug-2022 & Rs.24,24,660/- |All that part and parcel of the property Flat 12-0ct-2023 Rs. 10,00,000/- Shankar Jadhav Twenty Seven Only) | Measuring 301 Sq.Ft., Bldg No. A4, Xrbia Smartl Rs 15,69,667/-(Rupees | _ Earnest Money
3)Net Profit/ (Loss) for the period before tax | 98246 | 92.118 16.228 1.Mr.Dattatray Sidram | (Rupees Twenty Four Lakh (304, 3rd Floor, admeasuring 35.5 Sq. Mtrs.| Total Outstanding As |  (Rupees Ten 3. Mrs.Manisha Bid Increase Amount | City, Gat No. 36, 37, 39, 40 & 339, Talegaon| Fifteen Lakh Sixty Nine | Deposit (EMD)
(after Exceptional andlor Pawar, 2Mrs.Sunita | Twenty Four Thousand Sk | oot + aicony Area), Riddhivinayak Apt,| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Lakh Only) Tushar Jadhav _ | Rs. 20,000/- (Rupees Twenty| Midc Road, Ambi, Maval, Pune, 410506, M.H, Thousand Six Hundred | Rs.50,000/- (Rupees
Exiraons ome) Dattatray Pawar, Hundred Sixty Only) lelage Novai Paylghar e Mah;lrashtg Rs.29.38,235- (Rupees [ Eamest Money (Prospect No 786695) Thousand Only) India.(Area admeasuring 296 sq. ft.) Sixty Seven Only) Fifty Thousand Only)
xtraordinary items Sanika E i ; | ) \ , N ’ : - : —Jan- ' A
4)Net Profit/ (r{oss) for the period 73423 | 67550 12.178 3sa(glr:sp2§rﬁgses nggfulggf-ef;fpgenfr"ﬁémy India-401404 TVE?Q”H Trossmd e |Rs. ?fm'ﬁ?os&f-E (I'\gIL)u))ees Ramts".fé'hg,'ﬂ,"‘é’upta Rs. 9,s§3&’3ﬁ'{§3§§es Nine ﬁ!ﬁ“ﬁ;’"ﬁj_”,‘ig ar;,i Of,;t;e pcr:pear;ymb::snﬁ Totalogt;jt:?ai:?:g as <R5;e§”g%£goé’kh
after tax (after Exceptional andior 1L10176034) Thousand Only) (Super built up area 554 sq. ft.) Hundred Thirty Five Only)] — One Lakh Only) | 2. Mrs.Suman Manoj | Lakh Eighty Five Thousand |~ " » Bieg Ro. Le, U9 On Date 03-Jan-2024 Only)
\atter txcep 1.Mr. Rupnarayan | 16-Mar-2023 & Rs.21,95518/- [All that part & parcel of the property Flat No. A- 22-Sep-2023 Rs. 10,00,000/- Gupta Nine Hundred Only) | 14.59 Sq. Mtrs., Xrbia Eiffel City, Chakan, Pune,( pg 15 75 993). (Rupees [ Earnest Money
Extraordinary items ) Brijanandan Tiwari | (Rupees Twenty One Lakh (204, Carpet Area Ad Measuring 434 Sq.Ft, Built| Total Outstanding As (Rupees Ten (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | 410206, Maharashtra,India Fifteen Lakh Twenty Five|  Deposit (EMD)
ivei i 2.Mrs.Uma Ninety Five Thousand Five [Up Area Ad Measuring 418 Sq. ft. and Super| - Jan-. Lakh Onl: 779321 Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twen Thousand Nine Hundred | Rs.50,000/- (Rupees
5) Total Comprehensive income for the period | 73.423 67.550 12.178 ! : On Date 03-Jan-2024 y) (BUA- 236 sq. ft) p
[Comprising Profit/(Loss) for the period Rupnarayan Tiwari Hundred Eighteen Only) _|Buit Up Area 587 Sq. Ft, 2nd Fir, Bldg I- 2,| pg 26,26,705/- (Rupees Earnest Money Thousand Only) g1 Ninety Three Only) Fifty Thousand Only)
prising P 3.Tiwari Enterprises Bid Increase Amount | Vardhaman Shrushti, Phase Il , Constructed on| Tyenty Six Lakh Twenty | Deposit (EMD)  [1. Mr. Harihar Suresh | 26-Sep-2022 & Rs.18,58,905/- All that part and parcel of the property bearing 01-June-2023 Rs.10,00,000 /-
(after tax) and other Comprehensive (Prospect No Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty [Survey No.311, Vill. Aliyali , Near Kenam Eng.| iy Thousand Seven | Rs.1,00,000/- (Rupees Mohod (Rupees Eighteen Lakh Fifty [Flat No 12, 3rd Floor, Carpet Area Ad| Total Outstanding As | (Rupees Ten Lakh
1L10302455) Thousand Onl School Taluka Dist. Paighar, MH. 401404. | “Hundred Five Ol Cne Lakh Onl j Eight Thousand Nine Hundred 18 ’ - Or Dot 0323024 Only)
Income (after tax)] ousand Only) undred Five Only) ne Lakh Only) 31 MLS'P,'VT’?,'“S gl DUFSSQ om';])e undred) Measuring 385 Sq.Ft., and Super Built Up Area| On Date 03-Jan-2024 y
P - 1. Mr.Rupesh Tanaji | 21-Dec-2022 & Rs.23,50,935/- |All that part and parcel of the property Flat 13-Sep-2023 Rs. 10,00,000/- arihar Voho Ad M ing 520 Sq.Ft. on Wing B Chandra| Rs-23,64,663/- (Rupees Earnest Money
6) Equity Share Cap'|tal . 2120.070 |2120.070 | 2120.070 2.Mrs.Tar'|)aji Kalura]m (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh (301, 03Rd Fir, Carpet Area Ad Measuring 351 Total Outstanding as | (Rupees Ten Lakh (Prospect No. Bid Increase Amount |, L gaon Dr?améhere lPl?ne 412008, | Twenty Three Lakh Sixty|  Deposit (EMD)
7)Reserves (excluding Revaluation 1132.064 |1058.640 | 1788.050 Chaudhari Fifty Thousand Nine Hundred |5, £y “ang Super Built Up Area Ad Measuring| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Only) 754697) Rs. 20,000/ (Rupges Twenty Maharathtra. India ' ' ’| FourThousand Six hun- | Rs.1,00,000/- (Rupees
Reserves as shown in the Balance 3VN En_terpriseﬁ i Thirty Five Only) 384 Sq.Ft, Riddhivinayak Apt, Kunti Nagar, Rs.28,53,§13/- (Rupe_:es Earnes_t Money Thousand Only) ) 3 : dred Sixty Three Only) One Lakh Only)
) 4.Mr.Yogita Tanaji Bid Increase Amount |5\ ) aharashtra, India. 401404 | 1wenty Eight Lakh Fifty Deposit (EMD) 1. Mrs. Tanveer  |22-Dec-2022 & Rs.16,05,641 /-| All that part and parcel of the property bearing 06-Oct-2023 Rs.13,00,000/- (Rupees
Sheet of previous year) Chaudhari (Prospect | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty |"29nah Thane, Maharashira, India, Three Thousand Three | Rs.1,00,000/- (Rupees | Shafiq Shaikhdesai | (Rupees Sixteen Lakh Five | Flat No 302, 2nd Floor, admeasuring 463 Sq. FtI Totar o ing As |_Thirteen Lakh Only)
8)Eamings Per Share No IL10168573) Thousand Only) (Super built up area 535 sg. ft.) Hundred Thirteen Only) | One Lakh Only) _|2. Mr. Shafiq Sabeblal | Thousand Six Hundred Forty |(Carpet Area) & 585 Sq. Ft. (Super Built Up| ‘on Date 03-Jan-2024 Eamest Money
. . i One Only) Area), Level 5 Amenity ViewJ Wing, Pratham| Rs 19 76 432/ (R D it (EMD
before extraordinary items 1. Mr. Mohammad | 24-Aug-2022 & Rs.16,58,656/- [All that part and parcel of the property Fiat No. 07-Nov-2023 Rs.7,00,000)- (Rupees Desai . ; $.19,76,4321- (Rupees eposit (EMD)
Eof Rs. 10/- each) yems) Arman (Rupges Sixtoen Lakh Fifty 302, 3rd Floor, admeasuring 29.63 S. Mit[ Togal Outstanding as |S€"en Lakh Only) (P’f,’;"fg)m Rs, ag Increase Amount Eﬂi"h‘i,?;gh"l":ﬁgé‘.’2122&“?&?396%Arez”s”gi' Nineteen Lakh Severly | Rs-1,30,0001- (Rupces
S 2. Mrs. Noorbano | Eight Thousand Six Hundred |(carpet Area), Floor No. 3, Wing 3A,| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money S- Five Th(;ésaur?:%snlyv;/eny Sq.Ft) Hundlrzd T?]l;rsénnglgnl) Tr?:usznd O’:F);
Basic: 0.346 0.032 0.057 Arman Qureshi Fifty Six Only) Paramount Enclave. Building No. 3A And 38.| R5.20,22,129/- (Rupees Deposit (EMD) Y Y
; ' 9 i All that part and parcel of th rty Flat N /-
Dikted 0345 | 0082 | 0057 (ProspeciNo | Re 2o i upees ety [LMaNm Palghar (West), Nahrashr,ni-| Y 20 et M | ReTLRVLy Fpees: | Lchehaveer Pawan | 1900y 080 Lo 20 o meeeing 605 o0 . Corpot| Tomoenazs | Ton Lok Oy
’ s.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty i A ! ; ousand One Hundre even ousan umar Shukla, 2. Mrs. ! , 2na Floor, measuring sq . Larpet| Total O as
Earnings Per Share 1L10161198) Thousand Only) 401404 (Super built up area 490 sq. ft.) Twenty Nine Only) Only) (Guddi Pawan Shukla, 3. F’{“mg‘deO“f T“OL'%a"d OFO‘L" Area, Building No 2, Wing 4, Shree Township,| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money
(after extraordinary items) (of Rs. 10/- each) 1. M. Kadaji Pralhad | 02:Dec-2021 & Rs.13,24,271- AT that part and parcel of the properly beafing| __11-July-2023___|Rs.8,00,000 /- (Rupees [MrPawan kumar Shesh| Hundred Seventy Two Only) |gico\- gy " gojsar, Village Kambaigaon,| Rs.36,59.6141- (Rupees | Deposit (EMD)
. (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Twenty [Flat No.404, Admeasuring 283 Sq.Ft. Floor m Eight Lakh Only)  [ram Shukla, 4. Mrs.Raghu| _ Bid Increase Amount st Thirty Six Lakh Fifty Rs. 1,00,000/-
Basic 0.346 0.032 0.057 Jaware Total O A Taluka and District Palghar, 401501 h ’
st : . . 2. Mrs.Suvama Four Thousand Two Hundred [No. 4, A3 2 Quartz, A3 2 Quartz, Playtor| ‘0" Date 03-Jan-2024 Eamest Money |25 Shukla| Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty Maharashira. India ' 'l Nine Thousand Six (Rupees One Lakh
Diluted: 0.346 0.032 0.057 - \ Seventy Nine Only) Eanjangaon,_lf’rlojfcthm GatD tho. F§97 4Y;Ilza19(;e Rs.17,10,603/- Deposit (EMD) (Prospect No 874814) — T:;J:ZSE:I!; 0;1\8)')74 S EL vd : — — Hundrezi ?;nze:%onm - 70;2/)0001
i i i i i i rospect No. Bid Increase Amount oregaon  lalukashirur DisL. Fune -|(Rupees Seventeen Lakh | Rs. 80,000/~ (Rupees . .| 01-Sep-: s.18,74,749/- | All that part and parcel of the property Flat bear- -UCt-2Y, s. 7,,00,000/-
El;ghzzov:slsum:rxtggt L?Ifattl?gnd%t(ia”g? R;m%tEOBfIFI(T_aiQt?rllal Roebsllimastif(l)lﬁg Vy%ﬁz&iﬁ% 1L10154682) Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty [Near Kareshwar Temple In Koregaon Area Ten Thousand Six | Eighty Thousand Only) |1- Mr. Vinod P Sahani| " (Rupees Eighteen Lakh ~ |ing No. 401, on Fourth Floor admeasuring 425[ Total Outstanding As | (Rupees Seven Lakh
ang g g gatior 3 4 Thousand Only) (Built up area :- 382 sq. ft.) Hundred Three Only) 2. Mrs. Sunayanadevi | Seventy Four Thousand Seven|Sq. Ft. Carpet Area, in the building known as| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Only)
Req;ﬂ[ﬁments% Reguéaﬂonsf, 2h015c. The full format of thef quarterlly flnancgl Lesuslts Ii T Vibhish 20-Dec-2022 All that part and parcel of the property Flat No 22-Sep-2023 Rs.12,00,000/- (Rupees P Sahantl N Hundred Forty Nine Only)  |"Siree Township", Bidg. No. 8, Wing 16", Type Rs.27,71.391)- Earmest Money
available on the website of the Company i.e. www.profincaptial.com and the Stocl - Mr. Vibhishan oec h ~Oep- s rospect No - Aas per approve plan Constructed on N. A. land| (Rupees Twenty Seven !
i indi Yadav Rs.28,57,0761- (Rupees |1, Ground Floor, Carpet Area Ad MeasuringI=r"t-rey fing As |__IWelve Lakh Only) 874807) Bid Increase Amount |, - in ' Siivey No./Gut No. 10+58/ 1, admea-| - Lakh Seventy One Deposit (EMD)
Exchange .e. www.bseindia.com. For Pro Fin Capital Services Limited 2. Mrs.Neelu Twenty Eight Lakh Fifty Seven ;\‘Asezsﬁﬁhﬁ'%o%”g %‘tjp?; BBl:Ji:ginupN é\r:fa\‘,vﬁd On Date 03-Jan-2024 | Earnest Money Rs.20,000/- suringg11550 s%luare meters, of Village Kamba-|  Thousand Three. | Rs. 70000i- (Rupees
Sd- Vibhishan Yadav | Thousand Seventy Six Only) fMoasiiing 70 502t idency e Nagagr Rs.34,20,940)- (Rupees |  Deposit (EMD) (Rupees Twenty Thousand  {|qaon, Taluka and District Palghar, Maharashtra,|  Hundred Ninety One Seve”t(y)TlhOL'Sﬁnd
Place: Mumbai Anupam Gupta _3. M{S Laxmi Bid Increase Amount Mahim Road Village Tembhode Nr Maruti Thirty Four Lakh Twenty | Rs.1,20,000/- (Rupees Only) India- 401501 (Built Up Area 510 Sq. Ft.) Only) nly)
Date: 11/01/2024 Managing Director E"Qr"’:,eﬁ_';':)% é:;g:;:ect Rs.2F.’.),001(_)(‘. (RUPZESHW‘E”W Sales Service Palghar 401404, Maharashira, Thouse;:nd ngelHundred One Lakh Twenty 4 - Akshay Ashok | 19-Oct-2022 & Rs.14,98,588/-| All that part and parcel of the property bearing 25-May-2023 Rs.6,00,000/- (Rupees
ging ive Thousand Only) ~ \jn4ia’ (Area ad Measuring 713 Sq. Ft.) orty Only) Thousand Only) Antrolikar N(RUPEEShFQFJr?eeﬂ |aa||_§h Flat No 204, Admeasurimng Carpet Area 280[ Total Outstanding A Six Lakh Only)
" " - inety Eight Thousand Five p k|
1. Mrs.Kiran Sadashiv | 08-Sep-2022 & Rs.23,33,407/- |All that part and parcel of the property bearing 03-Aug-2023 Rs. 10,00,000/- 2. Mrs.Shakuntala Hundred Ei : Sq. Ft., Super Built Up area 365 Sq. Ft,, 2Nd| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money
9 . 4l Antrolik ighty Eight Only) o -
H H Nalawade, 2.Time To Be | (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh (Cts 1771, Flat No 401 4Th Fir, Ad-measuring i (Rupees Ten Lakh Akshay _ Floor, Gate No 218, Building No B 1, Plytor| Rs.19,66,481/- (Rupees Deposit (EMD)
D.M.K. Jaoli Sahakari Bank Ltd. Beautiful, 3.Abhishek | Thirty Three Thousand Four |Area 24.19 Sq. Mtrs, Lotus Building, Talegaon Toohang;lgsotgﬂ(iﬁgozﬁs Only) (Prg_lszl’;gst)m’ R %dolt')‘g’re(a;e Amo_lynt ty | Paud B, Pune, 412108, Maharashtra, India {\lrl]neteendLFakh ?_;xwds')é g; .tet#])om- (%uopeles)
(Reg. No. BOM/BNK/127 of 1973) ppliers, 4 Mrs.Manisha| __Hundred Seven Only) _ |Dabhade, Talegaon Dabhade, Pune,| R 27,64 976/- (Rupees | Earnest Money S.£0, 000" (RUpees WLy | g it up area 379 Sq.ft. ousand Four Hundred) Sixty Thousand Only
Regd Office A-418/20, Maulana Azad Road, Mumbai-400 004 Rohidzs Jambhulkar, 5. Mr. [ Bid Increase Amount | Maharashira, India, 410506 Twenty Seven Lakh Sixty | Deposit (EMD) Thousand Only) | {Bullt up o) | Eighty One Only)
Recovery Department A-418/20, Maulana Azad Road , Mumbai-400 004 (R;ha" R‘;h;faslfgmggg; Re.20,0005- (Rupees Twenty |(Carpet el 444 sq. ft. and Built up area:-|  Four Thousand Nine ~ | Rs.1,00,000/- (Rupees | 1. Mr. Vikas 30{?"9'2°2T2&5s§1’°f'5k7nsl' Alliat part and parcel of the pr_gpgr\*,\v/_ggahr;ng S-Nov-2023 Rs.14,70,000:- Rupee
’ ' rospect No. Thousand Onl! sq. ft. Hundred S Six Onl One Lakh Onl; upees Twenty One Lal . 203, Al I V- otal Outstanding ourteen Lakh Seven
CellNo-8691096107/9763425738 : : 2 . undred Seventy S Dnk) D) Bhrugunath Pandey | L P e tundred [ing a Carpef aréa of 584 g . (including el As O Date Thousand Only)
RE-AUCTION NOTICE 1. Mr. Vicky 29-Aug-2022 & Rs.30,98,574)- 10\2 théqt ?agl and %rcel :f %1}(19 propeRy Frltat Nf;. 13-Oct-2023 Rs]_.12i00,30lk1{](%upl>e)es v r. -Irgg::dey Seventy Eight Only) area of balcony and proporiionate area of 03-Jan-2024
= Kannaujiya (Rupees Thirty Lakh Ninety , 1t Floor, Wing A, Dhanani Apartment, o) i welve Lakh Only Wikt f the said Building i. e. Th . Earnest Money
Recovery certificate bearing Nos- 101/2459 /2018 and 101/2460/ 2 MraDoge | Eight Thousand Five Hundred [area admeasuring 55.29 Sq. Mirs, CHSL, Of| Topoutstanding As -— 3.Mrs. Savitri Devi | Bid Increase Amount |y Shace) of the said Bulding | e The| Rs-27,94.767) Deposit (EMD)
P: " ; A On Date 03-Jan-2024 arnest Money (Prospect No uilding which is presently known as| (Rupees Twenty Seven
2018 issued by Deputy Registrar co-op societies, Maharashtra 3. Mis Shiv Shakti Seventy Four Only) _|New Salpali Road, Village Tembhode, Behind| R 33 71.402i- (Rupees |  Deposit (EMD) 87?1 22) Rs.25,000/- "Parshwa" Flat No 203 Second Floor C Wing,|  Lakh Ninety Four Rs. 1,47,000/-
state (on Deputation) Mumbai Dated: 16.05.2018 Drycleaners Bid Increase Amount | Water Tank Tembhode, Palghar West, Palghar,|  Thirty Eight Lakh | Rs.1,20,000/-(Rupees (Rupees Twenty Five | Parshva BldgSwapnalok Residency, Umrolil  Thousand Seven (Rupees One Lakh
Dep ted: 16.05. (Prospect No Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty [Maharashtra, India, 401404 - (Super Built Up| Seventy One Thousand |  One Lakh Twenty Palghar, Palghar, Maharashtra, India- 401404| Hundred Sixty Seven | FOrty Seven Thousand
Sealed tenders are invited from General public for sale of the attached 1L10127201) Five Thousand Only) ~ |Area ad Measuring 671 Sq. Ft.) Four Hundred Two Only) |~ Thousand Only) Thousand Only) (Built up area admeasuring 700 sq. ft.) Only) Only)
Premises in the name M/S Krishna Enterprises Prop. shri Pradeep 1. Mr. Kashivel Natraj | 11-0ct-2022 & Rs.29,53,836/- | Al fhat part and parcel of the properly Flat 18 14-Aug-2023 Rs.12,00,000/- (Rupees | 4wy Akhilesh kumar | 07-Jan-2022 & Rs.14,11,815/- (Al that part and parcel of the property Flat Noj 10-0ct-2023 Rs.7,00,000/- (Rupees
Ravaji Patel which is given as Security by registered Mortgage for the Nadar | (Rupees Twenty Nine Lakh D Wing, Admeasuring Land area 670 Sq. Ft.,[Total O jing As | TwelveLakh Only) |Gyt 2 Mr. Chandra| — (Rupees Fourteen Lakh (304, admeasuring 224.75 sq. f. Carpet Area and Total Outstanding as | Seven Lakh Only)
loan of M/s Sun Shine Gift (Prop. Mr Haresh Ravji patel) on "as is where" 2.Mrs.Kanagalaxmi anm;eTm°ussf’;Q%Eig?t Carpet Area 444 Sq. Ft., Built Up Area 996 Sq| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money prakash G Gupta , Eleven Thousand Eight |Balcony Area admeasuring 25.08 sq. ft., on the| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money
basis which is taken in physical Possession by Recovery officer, 3 Klggf\?gslay:g;tre Bid Increa:eyAmounz -ft. Bldg 2 3Rd Fir Shiv Datta Chs! near Shree Ti?ﬁ::ls'i'ﬂé“eofgk(r\R'lngZﬁfy Rs. ?Z%oosl;to;E(I!{ﬁLﬁ))ees . Gan(g;aditn Hundred Fifleen Only) | 3Th Floor, In the Projact named as Ambrosia 8, gesv'g:t’zghsglk'h(g:egﬁtsy Rs D;l;)g(s);ltl(%yu?))ees
Under Maharashtra co-op societies Act 1960 and Rules 1961 for the (ProspectNo | Rs. 25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |<rushna Mandir Palghar East, Palghar,| "one Thousand Four | One Lakh Twent fahi ¢ G Bid Increase Amount [ siuated at revenue Vilage Mahim, Tal Dist| ScCoert erl s il Ba o Thousand
P p Y . Y| 4.Mrs.Nidhi C Gupta Palghar, 401404, Maharashtra, India.(Super 9 y
Recovery of 1) Overdraft Loan Facilities Rs 1,63,51,847, plus further IL10099722) Five Thousand Only) _ |Maharashtra, India, 401404. Hundred Six Only) Thousand only) | (Prospect No 862168) Rs'zo'%?w' (R‘épgef Twenty Bui?tu;; area admeasuring 375 sq, ft) PETl Hundred Eighty Seven Only)
interest at @ 13% p.a. and 2) Business Loan Facilities of Rs 1,28,42,707 1.Miss. Shweta Sanjay| 23-Sep-2022 & Rs.22,10,509/- [All hat part and parcel of the property bearing 04-Jul-2023 Rs. 10,00,000 /- ousand Only) - Only)
of total outstanding Rs 2,91,94,554/- (Two Crore Ninety One Lakhs Netke (Rupees Twenty Two Lakh - [Flat No C2 1202, Floor No 12, Carpet area| Total Outstanding as (Rupees Ten Lakh | 1. Mr. Taibul Shaikh | 20-Aug-2022 & Rs.11,66,344/- All that part and parcel of the property Flat No 11-Jul-2023 Rs.7,00,000/- (Rupees
g I 1,94, y 2. Miss. Manali Satish | Ten Thousand Five Hundred B " Jan. Only) 2. Mrs. Yasmina | (Rupees Eleven Lakh Sixty Six| 508, Admeasuring 224.75 Sq Ft Carpet Area| Outstandi Seven Lakh Only)
Ninety Four Thousand Five Hundred Fifty Four Only ) as on 01.10.2018 S e Nine Only) admeasuring 363 Sq. Ft, Bldg No C2, Manira) On Date 03Jan-2024 |y Bagam Thousand Three Hundred |and 25.08 Sq.Ft Balcony Area , 05Th Floor | Toia g S | —amest W
: : : amble : Residency, Gat No. 01 Village Nighoje Taluka| RS-26,14,089/- (Rupees | Earnest Maney 9 Forly Four Only) | Ambrosia 5Survey No. 4031 ( 403/1p)| poryDate 03-Jan-2024 | Earnest Honey
with further interest till the date of repayment from the above Borrower. Bid Increase Amount | - Sl 0 ey Twenty Six Lakh Deposit (EMD) _ previraom g bt West. Palahoy Rs.17,41,012/- (Rupees | _ Deposit (EMD)
The details of the Residential premises are given below. (IFI’_’1°0505395‘5,‘6'1;’- RS-ZO%OI-(RléDge? )TWe“ty (BuiltU Area Ad Measuring 484,04 § Ft) F%unée’{ll Thtz)usla;m RS-(1),00,|?0|34- (()Rlu;)Jees ¢ +No 853597)| R Igadolgglre(aRse Anw]yntt 10104 lvfaharasr:iraa Ign d?a’ est, Faignar) ngentTehen Lakg FO(?V R;- 70v2°°T/;](R“Pe§S
ousand Only uilt Up Area easuring 484.04 Sq. Ft. ixty Nine Only) ne Lakn Only, rospect No $.20,000/- (Rupees Iwenty Rl , (NI ne Thousand an eventy Thousan
Description of the Reserve | EMD |Date, Place and 1.Mr. Vishvambhar | 18-0ct-2022 & Rs.29,20,091/- |All that part and parcel of the property bearing 25.0ct-2023  |Rs. 15,20,000)- (Rupee Thousand Only) (Built up area admeasuring 340 5. ft) _ Twelve Only) Only)
Mortgage Property Price time of Auction Mahesh Solanki T(RlJloteeTshTwenwj Nin;hakl;y Flat No 402, 4th Fir, A-Wing, admeasuring 495( Total Outstanding as Fif}ehen Lakg gwler)ny 1 Mr. Madanlal 30-&pr-2ozzT ﬁ- n';sfsz’14fr?sl' All that part and parcel of the property bearing| 21-Aug-2023 (Ruﬁzégqugﬁgoé}gm
- 2Mrs. Kusum Mahesh| Twenty Thousanc and NInely |gq gt (Carpet Area) & 559 Sq. Ft. (Built Up| On Date 03-Jan-2024 ousand Only Ramdeo Pal upees Thirty Two Lakh | njt No-C-1406, 14th Floor, Admeasuring| Total Outstanding as
'\Pnl'/%p?(rty EwneEr S Nan]e 12 (l))za t2e02 4 Solanki, 3.Mr. Mahesh One Only) Aq ) &( 7a7r1p es reFat) (Super Eciluilt U( u)\rea)p Rs?34;l§907l-a(?{upees Earnest Money Deposit| 2. Mrs.AshaMadanlal | Fourteen Thousand Five 50.82 Sq. Mirs.. Sunteck West World 1. Ti 9 On Date 03-Jan-29024 Lakh Only)
rishna Enterprises -02.2C¢ Lallubhai Solanki Bid Increase Amount | -/ g 7L Sup P 21%8) Thicty Four Lakh Ninety | (EMD) Rs.1,52,000) Pal Hundred Thirty Eight Only) |50.62 5. Mus., Sunteck West World 1, TT| p 42, 06,463/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
(Prop.Mr Pradeep Raviji patel) Place:- (Prospect No. | R, 25,000/~ (Rupees Twenty [Bulding No 1, Gayatri Park, Palghar, Palghar,| 1ousang Nine Hundred | (Rupees One Lakn Fity | 3. Madan Academy [~ Bid Increase Amount |Vasai, Palghar Maharashtra- 401208, India | _ Forty Two Lakh Six | (EMD) Rs. 2,80,000/-
1) Flat No- A/703, Amrut View Rs Rs Registered 1L10093038) Five Thousand Only) ~ |Maharashtra, India-401404. Seven Only) Two Thousand Only) (Pros;;;e<8:172?8.7882104 Rs.4lJ1,_IrJ]00/- (qupeeis Forty (Built up area 720 sq. ft) Thousand Four Hundred E‘(Iﬁup_?_ﬁs Two(li.eél;h|
co-op CHS Ltd, Plot No-|72,78,168.00|7,27,817.00| Office of 1. M. Mithlesh Chotelal| 01-Sep-2022 & Rs.14,51,828/- |All that part and parcel of the property Flat No. 27-Jul-2023 |Rs. 7,00,000/- (Rupees ) ousand Only) Sixty Three Only) ighty Thousand Only)
47/48, Sector No- 3, Karjande, D.M.K. Jaoli Prajapati, 2. Mr. (Rupees Fourteen Lakh Fifty 301, admeasuring carpet area 242 Sq.ft, 3rd| Total 0 jing As |__Seven Lakh Only) LMY, Mukesh | 21-Apr-2022 & Rs.24,16,489/- All that part and parcel of the property Flat No- 18-May-2023 Rs.7,00,000/- (Rupees
New Panvel, Dist- Rigad Sahakari Bank Chotelal Kavaldhari | One Thousand Eight Hundred |Fjoor  Ambrosia-8, Mahim Road Palghar,| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money 'Kﬂma;;s (Rupees Twenty Four Lakh |G-02 admeasuring 39.82 sq.mtr., Ground|Total O g as On |__Seven Lakh Only)
S I Prajapati, 3. Mrs. Twenty Eight Only) |+ arashra, India, 401404 Rs.17,67,135 (Rupees | _ Deposit (EMD) | 5 wrs. Sushila Bai | o cen Thousand Four - leior KM, Residency, Pam Tembi Vilage,| _ Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money
admeasuring 1050 built up L':/?, 7118/2AO/2§, PSumitra(ghhote La'& Bid Increase Amount |, o "5 it o aren Ad Measuring: 363| SSventeen Lakn Sty | Rs. 70,000/ (Rupees | iprocpee N Hundred Eighty Nine Only) |\ iavan Nagr, Boiser (West)Pa, Paighar,| [RS-3399,927- (Rupees |  Deposit (EMD)
area aulana Aza rajapati (Prospect No | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty : . Seven Thousand One Seventy Thousand 875767) Bid Increase Amount 1,0/ Mahara;htra India T *| Thirty Three lakh Ninety Nine | Rs. 70,000/ (Rupees
2) Flat No- B/904, Amrut View Rs Rs Road, Mumbai- 1L10053287) Thousand Only) Sa.ft) Hundred Thirty Five Only) Only) Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty » e ’ Thousand Nine Hundred |  Seventy Thousand
co-op CHS Ltd , Plot No- 47/ |72,78,168.00|7,27,817.00 400004 1. Mr. Kamal C Giri | 07-0ct-2021 & Rs.17,63,154)- All that part and parcel of the property Flat No 10-0c¢t-2023 Rs. 8,50,000/- (Rupees Thousand Only) (Super built up area 622 sq. ft.) , Twenty Seven Only) Only)
48, Sector No- 3,Karjande Time:- 2. Mrs. Nitu Kamal Giri ngi‘upeeTshSevenae%n Lﬂ(h ilxtg 206, having Carpet Area Admeasuring 33.72 Total Outstanding As _llf_rl]ght Laléhglflty) 1.Mr. Yogesh Ambalal Rs.30 5}9587(:;-%}222 & Thit IAll that part and parcel of the property bearing | Symbollic Possession R’s:zfgs,zoﬁogg/}(r{u;t;;e
’ > e : ree Thousand One Hundre i - Jan- ousand Only, Waghela, 2Mr.  |Rs.30,53,307/- (Rupees Thirty [Flat no.301, Land Area 605 sq. ft., on 3rd floor 02-Jan-2023 ifteen Lakh Twen!
New Panvel, Dist- Rigad 2.00 P.M. Fity Four Only) sq mtrs., Second Floor,Wing F, Type F, Thakur| On Date 03-Jan-2024 _ Lakh Fifty Three Thousand |- o - 0 an. Thousand Only)
S ) ’ A Rs.20,66,485/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit | Ambalal Purshottam Y building no.1 in the building known as "Grace m i
admeasuring 1050 built up (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount .’L‘f.uchaya, Pasthal, Palghar, Maharashtra, Twenty Lakh S(ixtypSix (EMD) Rs.sg 00&_ Waghela, 3.Ayu shree| Three Hundred Seven Only) g ng € Total O g As
India, 401504 -09, 000 L - olony" on $.n0.360 Hissano.p situated at| On Date 03-Jan-2024 | tM D it
area 1L10050239) Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty ) A1 Thousand Four Hundred | (Rupees Eighty Five Tailoring, 4. Bid Increase Amount |\ o gt Talka Vasai District Th Rs.36,38,905/- (Rupees amest Money Uepost
Date & Tme of i on 03.02.2024 (B 1700 500 Thousand Only) (Super Built up area 508 sq. ft.) Eighty Five Only) Thousand Only) _ [ Mrs.Bhavana Yogesh | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty [1120° Boln Taluka Vasai District Thane, | EE 3 lhs  Fonett <EMD) ?-1{2&0‘3{&
ate & Time of inspection 03.02. (Between 11.00 am to 2.00 pm) 1. Mr. Jitendra | 25-May-2021 & Rs.22,65,862/- All that part and parcel of the property bearing 27-Apr-2023 Rs.16,00,000/-(Rupees | 'y g ér{ggggft Five Thousand Only) m:zasf;:ga‘izlgd: ;0)1 303 (Carpet area ad Eight Thousand Nine (19‘,5): ?iou:mg Onl;)y
Terms & conditions: Madhukar Ovhal | _(Twenty Two Lakh Sixty Five [Flat No 1302, ad measuring 30.37 sq.mtrs,| Total O 2s | Sixteen Lakh Only) : - HundredFive Only)
i ini it i 2. Mrs.Vaishali | Thousand Bight Hundred Sixty 1371, Floor Park View Bldg A2, Pune,| On Date 03-Jan-2024 | EarnestMoney | 1 My, Balaji Baburao 02-Sep-2022 Al that part and parcel of the properly bearing]  18-Sep-2023 | Rs.19,26,000/-(Rupee
T _The bld_forr,ns containing term_s and condltlon% of Auction or O,ther Jitendra Ovhal MMaharashtr& Rs.32,35,021/- (Rupees Deposit (EMD) T a]il Rs. 26,61,067/- (Rupees |Flat 15 Stilt 2nd Floor, area admeasuring Total Outsta:ding 25 0n Nir]eteen Lakh Twenty
information if any can be Obtained from the office of the Authorized Bid Increase Amount | ¢, o it up area admeasuring 441| LY Two Lakh Thiry Rs.1,60,000- | 5 Mrs Deepika Balaji| _Twenty Six Lakh Sixty One |459.26 sq. ft, Siddhesh Chsl Behind Crystall " Date 03-Jan-2024 | S Thousand Only)
Officer on any working day during office hours after Inspection (Prospect No. Rs.25,000/- (Rupees P P 9 FiveThousand Twenty | (Rupees One Lakh Patil Thousand Sixty Seven Only) | Park, Sai Darshan Building, Satpati Palghar| - Rs,32,86,995/Rupees - (Eamest Hoey Deposit (END]
date of the property on payment of Rs of 500/-. IL10038202) TwentyFive Thousand Only) [sa-ft) One Only) rs'Xty Thousand Only) | - 3. Shiv Garment Bid Increase Amount | Road, Palghar W, Palghar, Maharashtra, India,| Thirty Two Lakh Eighty |Rs.1,92,600/- (Rupees One
. X . L 1. Mr. Rajesh Suresh | 25-Jan-2023 & Rs.24,10,544/- [All that part and parcel of the property Flat No. 17-Aug-2023 Rs. 7,00,000/- (Rupees (Prospect No Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty 401404 (Super Built Up Area ad|  Six Thousand Nine ~ |Lakh Ninety Two Thousand
2. The intending bidder should send their bids in Closeg envelops along Moganwm (Rupees Twenty Four Lakh [105, 1st Floor , Carpet Area Ad Measuring 438 Total 0 ing A Seven Lakh Only) 1L10106238) Five Thousand Only) Measuring 657 Sq. Ft.) Hundred Ninety Five Only)|  six Hu)rl1dred Only)
with interest every Free Earnest Money Deposit Of Rs 7,27,817/- 2. Mrs.Nirupama Ten Thousand Five Hundred |Sq.Ft. And Super Built Up Area Ad Measuring| on Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Mone: N :
and 7,27,817/- by way of PO/DD favoring DMK Jaoli Sahakari Bank Rajesh M denwal Forty Four Only) 670 Sq.Ft., Wing D Bldg No.10 Navapur Rd, Rs?27,g{531l-1%upees Deposit (EMD¥ 1-Mrs. Heena Dinesh zgéﬁzzﬁso%ir%y%si'xsfﬁ{sgﬂl' ?{LI“SL"ZG; ”éaﬁ;;ieL?ef;“,idpﬁi:?ﬁrﬁzaﬂﬂi T ,?'0“'2922 i Tﬁféﬁ?y’(gﬁ?ﬂéﬁlgﬁi)
Lid ble at Mumbai. The bid t b ived by the R (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount  |Palm Village Sodhi Presidency, Boisar West-| Twenty Seven Lakh Fifty | Rs. 70,000/~ (Rupees 2. Mr.Sant !{16 ind| Thousand Six Hundred Eighty - OU%, ! Y otal s
, payable at Mumbai. The bids must be received by the Recovery 1L10031723 & Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty 401504, Palghar, 401504 ,Maharashtra, India.| - Seven Thousand Five Seventy Thousand . Mr. aRp als P ovin only) Sq.Ft and Super Built Qp Area Ad Measuring| On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Money
Officer on or before 12.02.2024 upto 2 p.m. The bids received after 1L10141019) Thousand Only) (Area Ad Measuring 690 Sg. Ft.) Hundred Thirty One Only) Only) atho! Bid Inoroase Amaan | 643 Sa-Ft. 8th Floor, Wing C, Bidg No. 3, Zeal erséﬁigﬁggfa(kiu&%zs R 2%056:) }E('faﬁ)ees
the prescribed date and time will not be accepted. The tender will be 1.Mr. Dinesh Tikaram | 14-Sep-2022 & Rs.10,44,548/- |All that part and parcel of the property bearing 04-Jul-2023 Rs.5,00,000/- (Rupees (ProspectNo. | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | 69ency. HlL Layout, Global City, Virar West, Thotkand Four Hundred [T Lakh Ten Thousand
opened on 12.02.2024 at 2.00 p.m. at the above Mentioned address. Vishwakarma | (Rupees Ten Lakh Forty Four |iag No C2 - 202 Area Admeasuring 236 St Total Outstanding as [ 1ve L2k Only) 1L10047344) Five Thousand Only) | Palghar - 401303, Thane, Maharashtra, India |~ seventy Three Only) only)
i lousand Five Hundred rol
The Bidders present will be given an opportunity to improve upon Diraoh stk Eight Onh) - [Super BuiftUp Avea, Buiding C-2 Xrbia Eife] paryo s sup miocas | Farmest one! DateofInspecton o property EMD Last Date Datel Time of E-Auction
their bids. (Prospect No. Bid Increase Amount _|City Chakan, Pune, Maharashira, Indi Thirteen Lakh Fifty Six_ | Rs. 50,000/- (Rupees -Jan- rs 1400 hrs 25-Jan-2024 il 5 pm. 30-Jan-2024 1100 hrs-1300 hrs.
3. The Successful bidder shall be required to pay 25% of the finalized 1L10001374) Rs.20,1t_)£0/- (Rtépge? ;I'wenty ( I(iyarpei: ::e’a :zel’lle:sj::; ::7 r;qlaFt) Thoéj'si':dEF'om gumred Fifty Thousand Only) mﬁgﬁgohflr:‘akyamveal;lt;-b lI:_eN:‘Erpt?\{amperrr‘:; ear;; Itos Egur;zagi :isdeet %r:‘lir;e mode only. To make payments you have to visit https://www.iiflonehome.com and pay
. . . . . ousand Only) - FL, ighty Eight Only; A
bid amount including earnest Money immediately on 12.02.2024 and - Note: Payment link for each property/ Secured Asset is different. Ensure you are using link of the property/ Secured Asset you intend to buy vide public auction.
o ! : ini 22-Sep-2022 & Rs.15,23,971/- |All that part and parcel of the property bearing 27-Apr-2023 Rs.11,00,000 /- . p X .
balance 75% within 30 days i.e on or before 12.03.2024 till 4.00 p.m. 1.Mrs. Nandini (RupePes Fifteen Lakh Twenty |S No 850, Hissa NoSal6 14/5A/7, Flat No 101 pr: - (Rupees Eleven Lakh For bal_ance payment, upon successful bid, has to pay through RTGS/NEFT. The accounts details are as follows: a) Name of the Account:- IIFL
N A o ) Jyotiram Chavan 2. Thin Th  Nine Hundred |First Floor. Ad e Camet Area 496 S Total Outstanding as only) Home Finance Ltd., b) Name of the Bank:- Standard Chartered Bank, c) Account No:-9902879xxxxx followed by Prospect Number, d) IFSC Code:-
4. In case the successful bidder fails to pay 25% of the bid amount as Mrs. Krushnabai T e ! l)"‘ "l M°°sfv mea%’g',”g o e ozg’ OnDate 03-Jan-2024 | ™) SCBL0036001, e) Bank Address: Standard Chartered Bank, 90 M.G. Road, Fort, Mumbai-400001.
mentioned in clause 3 above the Earnest Money Deposited will Chavan, 3. Shree Seventy Y oharashtiaongy o ane: Fune. | Rs.20,36,321)- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit TERMS AND CONDITIONS:-
stand forfeited similarly. if the successful bidder fails to pay the Naveli Beauty Clinic Bid Increase Amount IS Built Up Area Ad M ing 520 S Twenty LakhThirty Six | (EMD) Rs.1,10,000 |1, For participating in e-auction, Intending bidders required to register their details with the Service Provider https:/iwww.iiflonehome.com well in
Y 0 pay And Sliming Center | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |(Super Built Up Area easuring 4. Thousand Three Hundred | (Rupees One Lakh Ten advance and has to create the login account, login ID and password. Intending bidders have to submit / send their "Tender FORM" along with the pay-
balance amount on or before 10.02.2024 the amount paid till date (Prospect No.961399) Five Thousand Only) ~ |Ft.) Twenty One Only) Thousand Only) ment details towards EMD, copy of the KYC and PAN card at the above mentioned Branch Office.
will stand forfeited and property shall be put up again for sale and re 1. Mr. Jitendra Prasad | 05-Nov-2021 & Rs.21,24,077/- All that part and parcel of the property Flat No. 24-Aug-2022 Rs.10,00,000/- (Rupees 2. The bidders shall in]prove their oﬁgr in multiple_ of avmount mentioned under the column "Bid In_crease Amount". In case bid is placed in the last 5 min-
. - M. Jitenr: (Rupees Twenty One Lakh  [104, on First Floor of Wing No. 09, Building 3 Ten Lakh Only) utes of the closing time of the auction, the closing time will automatically get extended for 5 minutes.
sold at a later date through fresh Auction. 2Mrs. Ahi%ya Devi Twenty Four Thousand  [No. 04, known as "Shree Township" construct- T°“'g e 03.J 2022 On Earnest Mone 3. The successful bidder should deposit 25% of the bid amount (after adjusting EMD) within 24 hours of the acceptance of bid price by the AO and the balance 75%
5. All charges levies, taxes, society dues, Government dues and or Shivn Ray Seventy Seven Only) ed on land bearing Survey No 10+ 58/1 Off p, 33233 5-293/“ZR Deposit (EMD¥ of the bid amount within 15 days from the date of confirmation of sale by the secured creditor. All deposit and payment shall be in the prescribed mode of payment.
L . . 3Mrs.Sudha K . - Village Kambalgaon, Taluka District Palghar, $.92,99,92)- (RUpees R p1 00,000/ 4. The purchaser has to bear the cess, applicable stamp duty, fees, and any other statutory dues or other dues like municipal tax, electricity charges, land
any other liability /outgoing Accrued against the Property shall be -Wrs.sugha sumart Bid Increase Amount i } S| Thirty Two Lakh Thirty S. 1,00,090/- and all other incidental costs, charges including all taxes and rates outgoings relating to the property.
(Prospect No 899051) | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty [401501, Maharashtra, India Admeasuring 430|  Three Thousand Fi (Rupees One Lakh i i i i i i i i
borne by the successful bidder. P -&0, up wenty Sq. Feet . (S built 540 sq. ft. ree Thousand rive p 5. Bidders are advised to go through the website https: //www.iiflonehome.com and https://wwuw.iifl.com/home-loans/properties-for-auction for detailed
Thousand Only) q. Feet . (Super built up area 540 sq. ft.) | Hundred Twenty Nine Only) Only) i+ ; ; ot it B ; ; et ;
6. Th N - . terms and conditions of auction sale & auction application form before submitting their Bids for taking part in the e-auction sale proceedings.
. e Recovery Officer reserves his right to accept or reject any or ; : : e : ive bi : : §ID-
) ; Y 1. Mr. Vikas Bhimrao | 12-Oct-2022 & Rs.20,54,684/- |Al that part and parcel of the property bearing 31-Aug-2023 Rs.11,91,000/- (Rupee |6. For details, help procedure and online training on e-auction prospective bidders may contact the service provider E mail ID:-
all offers, and also Postponed /cancel the auction without assigning Jadhav (Rupees Twenty Lakh Fifty |Unit No 007, Ground Floor, Admeasurimg ot Outstanding as on | Eleven Lakh Ninety auction.hi@iifl.com, Support Helpline Numbers:@1800 2672 499.
any reason and also to modify the terms and conditions of the 2. Mrs.Neha Vikas Four Thousand Six Hundred |Carpet Area 384 Sq. Ft., Super Built up 582 Date 03-Jan-2024 One Thousand Only) |7. For any query related to Property details, Inspection of Property and Online bid etc. call IIFL HFL toll free no. 1800 2672 499 from 09:30 hrs
. R . . Jadhav Eighty Four Only) Sq. Ft., Tower Bldg 01, Happinest Palghar 1,/ R 24 27 422/-Rupees | Eamest Money Deposit (END) to 18:00 hrs between Monday to Friday or write to email:- auction.hi@iifl.com
Auction Sale without prior notice. Bid Increase Amount Village Nandore East, Palghar, 401404, Twehty’Fo’ur Lakh Twenty |Rs.1,19,100/- (Rupees One 8. Notice is_ her_eb_y given to above .said borrowers to collect the hou_sehold articles,which were lying in the §ecured asset at the time of taking physical
7. The publication is also statutory Notice of 30 days to the borrower/ (Prospect No 898291) | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Maharashira,india Seven Thousand Four | Lakh Nineteen Thousand possessionwithin 7 days, otherwise IIFL-HFL shall not be responsible for any loss of property under the circumstances. ) )
‘Thousand Only) (Area admeasuring 567 sq. ft.) Hundred Twenty Two Only)| ~ One Hundred Only) 9. Further the notice is hereby given to the Borrowers, that in case they fail to collect the above said articles same shall be sold in accordance with Law.
owner of the above Property. 10. In case of default in payment at any stage by the successful bidder / auction purchaser within the above stipulated time, the sale will be cancelled and
8. Tenderer should submit copy of Pan Card and any documents of 1. Mr. Raju Saroj l(lg-Feb-le)EZZh& Rsfak,ﬁeéssr?/- Al that part and parcel of the property Flat No 24-Aug-2022 Rsé7,00,080|£-h ((R)uFe)es the amount already paid will be forfeited (including EMD) and the property will be again put to sale.
: ¢ ; .Mr. Raj j ighteen Lakh Eighty |404. 4Th Floor, with built-up area of 50.60 Sq.| Total Outstanding A« even Lakh Only, 11. AO reserves the rights to postpone/cancel or vary the terms and condition of tender/auction without assigning any reason thereof. In case of any dis-
Residence or Business proof along with the tender form. 2Mr. Rajan Saroj | o g 6 Hundad [404 » with built-up 60:5q.| Tota S : 4 o ;
) J . . ) On Date 03-Jan-2024 Earnest Mone pute in tender/Auction, the decision of AO of IIFL-HFL will be final.
Dated : 13.01.2024 Sd/- Sixty Nine Only) Wirs, Shree Township, Buiding No 03 Wing| o %7927z nces | Deposit (EMD) 15DAYS SALE NOTICE UNDER THE RULE 9 SUB RULE (1) OF SARFAESI ACT, 2002
Place : Mumbai (Mr Vijaykumar Sahabrao Lakade) (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount  |[No 6, Boisar East, Palghar, 401501, Twenty Seven Lakh Rs. 70,000/ (Rupees | The Borrower are hereby nofified to pay the sum as mentioned above along with upto dated interest and ancillary expenses before the date of
: i 885622) Rs.20,000)- (Rupees Twenty [y 1o Seventy Three Thousand |  Seventy Thousand | Tender/Auction, failing which the property will be auctioned/sold and balance dues if any will be recovered with interest and cost
Recovery Officer Thousand Only) anarashira, india. One Hundred Fifty Only) Only) Place:- Maharashtra, Date: 13-Jan-2024 Sdl- Authorised Officer, IFL Home Finance Limited.
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